[image: image1]
CITY OF MARTINEZ




           CITY COUNCIL AGENDA

December 5, 2007
TO:


Mayor and City Council

FROM:

Don Salts, Deputy Public Works Director 




Mercy G. Cabral, Deputy City Clerk

SUBJECT:

Introduction of Ordinance Amending the MMC, Title 15, Buildings and Construction
DATE:

November 19, 2007
RECOMMENDATION:

Conduct public hearing to introduce an ordinance amending Title 15, Buildings and Construction, of the Martinez Municipal Code (MMC) by adopting the current International Building Code, I.A.P.M.O. Plumbing and Mechanical Codes and the National Electric Code.  
BACKGROUND:
The State Building Standards Commission reviews new model code standards approximately every three years.  After the modified standards are approved by the Building Standards Commission, cities are mandated to adopt them within six months or they become law by default.  The proposed changes to Title 15 will bring the City into compliance with the State mandate.
FISCAL IMPACT:
Department needs to purchase new code books and provide training for staff. Approximately $1,200 - $1,500 has been included in the current budget.  No additional fiscal impact.  
ACTION: 

Motion to introduce an ordinance amending Title 15, Buildings and Construction of the MMC.
[image: image2.wmf] 


APPROVED BY:  
[image: image5.png]




APPROVED BY:  



City Manager


Public Works Director

ORDINANCE NO.   C.S.

AMENDING TITLE 15, BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION, OF THE MARTINEZ MUNICIPAL CODE BY ADOPTING BY REFERENCE THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2006 EDITION; THE UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE, 2006 EDITION; THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE, 2006 EDITION; AND THE NATIONAL ELECTRIC CODE, 2005 EDITION

WHEREAS, approximately every three years new model code standards are reviewed, modified, and approved by the California Building Standards Commission, and then mandated for local jurisdictional enforcement; and

WHEREAS, the City of Martinez Public Works Department is responsible for enforcement of these codes.

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MARTINEZ DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION I.  Section 15.02, Building Official, of Title 15 of the Martinez Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.02.010
Building Official Designated.

The Community Development Director Public Works Director or his or her designee shall be designated as the Building Official for the purpose of enforcing all codes and regulations contained within or adopted by this Title.


SECTION II. Section 15.04, Building Code, of Title 15 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 15.04.010
Adoption of Uniform Building Code Adoption of the International Building Code. 

There is adopted by reference, with the exceptions set out herein, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area and maintenance of all buildings and structures in the City, the Uniform Building Code, 1997 Edition, International Building Code, 2006 Edition, including 2001 2007 State Amendments, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, including Chapters 3-Div II & Div IV and 15 through 34 of the Chapter 1, Volume II, Administration and Appendix i, Patio Covers; Appendix and the same is referred to, and made a part of this Chapter as if set out in full herein. 

15.04.026
Section 104.2.4 Amended—Stop Orders Section 114 Amended—Stop Work Orders.

Stop Work Orders…Rest remains the same.
15.04.030
Section 103 to 113.4.

15.04.035
Section 106.2 to 105.2.
106.2 105.2 Exempted Work.
15.04.040
Section 106.3.1. to 105.3

15.04.045
Permit Fees—Amend Table 1-A, UBC to Section 108.

15.04.125
UBC Section 1503 to IBC Section 1507—Roof Covering Requirements.

SECTION III.  Section 15.16, Mechanical Code, of Title 15 is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.16.010 
Adoption of the Uniform Mechanical Code.

There is adopted by reference with the exceptions and amendments set out herein for the purpose of prescribing minimum regulations for the installation, alteration, repair and location of heating, ventilating, cooling, refrigeration systems and other miscellaneous heat producing appliances, Tthe I.A.P.M.O Uniform Mechanical Code, 2000 2006 Edition, in its entirety including the Appendix and the 2001 2007 State Amendments.

SECTION IV.
Section 15.20, Plumbing Code, of Title 15 is hereby amended to read as follows:
15.20.010
Adoption of the Uniform Plumbing Code.

There is adopted by reference with the exceptions and amendments set out herein for the purpose of prescribing minimum regulations for the installation, alteration, repair and inspection of plumbing and drainage systems, the I.A.P.M.O. Uniform Plumbing Code, 2000 2007 Edition in its entirety including the 2001 2007 State Amendments, and the same is referred to and made a part of this chapter as if set out in full herein.

15.20.040
Section 103.4.1 Amended—Permit Fees. Section 108.4.2 Fees.


Delete entire section and substitute the following:

Permit fees for work regulated by this cChapter shall be as adopted from time to time by resolution of the City Council of the City of Martinez.
SECTION V.  Section 15.24, Electrical Code, of Title 15 is hereby amended to read as follows:
15.24.010  Adoption of National Electrical Code.

There is adopted by reference the National Electrical Code, 1999 Edition 2005 Edition, including the Uniform Administration Section as recommended by the National Fire Protection Association, with the exceptions and additions as set forth in this cChapter.; including the 2007 State Amendments.

15.24.030
Section 304(a) and Table 3-A, N.E.C. 


Section 89.108.4.2 Fees

Amend Section 304(a) and Table 3-A in its entirety and substituting the following in place thereof.

“Permit fees for work regulated by this Chapter shall be as adopted from time to time by resolution of the City Council. of the City of Martinez.”

15.24. 050
Departments Hhaving Jurisdiction

Unless otherwise provided for by law; the office of the Administrative Authority shall be a part of the Community Development Public Works Department.

SECTION VI.  Severability.  If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance.

The City Council hereby declares that it would have passed this and each section, subsection, phrase or clause thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, phrase or clauses be declared unconstitutional on their face or as applied.

SECTION VII.  Effective date.  This ordinance shall become effective 30 days after the date of adoption.

SECTION VIII.  Posting.  The City Clerk shall cause this ordinance to be published within fifteen days after its adoption, at least once, with the names of those city council members voting for or against the ordinance, in a newspaper of general circulation published and circulated in the City of Martinez.

APPROVED:_________________________









Rob Schroder, Mayor

ATTEST:_________________________


Deputy City Clerk

* * * * * *

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was duly and regularly introduced at a Regular Meeting of the City Council of the City of Martinez, held on the 5th day of December, 2007, and duly passed and adopted at a Regular Meeting of said City Council held on the   day of     , 2007, by the following vote:

AYES:



NOES:



ABSENT:



ABSTAIN:








RICHARD G. HERNANDEZ, CITY CLERK







CITY OF MARTINEZ

� EMBED Word.Picture.8  ���








[image: image3.wmf] 

[image: image4.png]


_1134972058.doc
[image: image1.png]






